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Fact Sheet  
 
About Agility  

 
 
 
 
Agility is a global logistics company with $5.2 billion in annual 
revenue and 26,000+ employees in more than 100 countries. It is 
one of the world’s top freight forwarding and contract logistics 
providers, and a leader and investor in technology to enhance 
supply chain efficiency.  

 
Lines of Business  

 
Agility’s core commercial business, Global Integrated Logistics 
(GIL), is one of the world’s top freight forwarders and providers of 
contract logistics. It offers ocean, air and road freight, warehousing 
and distribution, and integrated supply chain services in more than 
100 countries. Agility GIL also provides specialist solutions for 
capital projects, oil and gas, chemicals, and fairs and events 
logistics.   
 
Agility Logistics Parks is one of the largest private owners and 
developers of warehousing and light industrial parks in the Middle 
East, Africa and South Asia. It funds, builds and manages world-
class facilities and infrastructure that help companies operate in 
the world’s fastest-growing markets.  
 
Agility’s subsidiary companies offer fuel logistics, airport services, 
commercial real estate and facilities management, customs 
digitization, and remote infrastructure services.  

 
Employees  

 
More than 26,000 employees  

 
Locations  

 
Agility has more than 500 offices across 100 countries, with a 
strong and growing presence in emerging markets.  
 
Americas: 104 offices in 24 countries  
Asia Pacific: 160 offices, 24 countries  
Europe: 130 offices, 32 countries  
Middle East & Africa: 80 offices, 23 countries  

 
Investor Relations  

 
Agility is publicly listed on Boursa Kuwait (the Kuwait Stock 
Exchange) and Dubai Financial Market; ticker symbol: AGLTY. 
Around 14,000 shareholders, including institutional investors.  

  
Sustainability Agility is recognized for being in the top 10% of its industry for 

social and environmental responsibility by Ecovadis. Agility has an 
education-focused community investment program that reaches 
more than 5,000 young people a year around the world. The 
company works with humanitarian partners to provide pro bono 
logistics services and expertise, and has supported more than 75 
emergency logistics operations in more than 25 countries to date. 
Agility is also strongly focused on supporting customers green 
their supply chains, as well as on protecting the environment in its 
own operations. 

 


